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Town ot'jamestowii
Town Oerk'y Office

Town Halt, 93 NarragansettAveniie
Jamestown, Rhode Island 02835-1199

401-423-9800 . Fax 423-7230
email: rfagaQ@jamestownri. neI Roberta J. Pagan

Town Clerk

Probate f'lerk

June 28, 2024

Jeffrey and Deborah Saletin
14 Seaview Avenue
Jainestown, E.I02835

Re: Water Service Extension R uest

Dear Mr. and Ms. Saletin,

The following is the decision on your application for a water main extension and associated service
connection outside of the Jamestown Urban Water District, dated January 2, 2024, to property
identified as 14 Seaview Avenue, Jamestown, R. I. (AP 7 Lot 135) and placed on the Town of
Jamestown Water and Sewer Commission ("Comniission") meeting agenda for consideration and
action.

Your application, along with three other applications for similar water service extension and
connection requests to their nearby properties, was first considered by the Commission at their
February 20, 2024, meeting. At their February 20, 2024, meeting, your application was continued
because several new documents in support of your application were submitted that evening. The
Commission continued your application for review and consideration to theu- meeting set for April
15, 2024. At the April 15, 2024, Commission meeting, your legal counsel made a statement into
the record that you have been experiencing water-related issues at your property since 2018. Your
legal counsel explained that your well exhibited low water quantity and poor water quality due to
saltwater intrusion issues. ' Your legal counsel farther stated that your well was producing yields
of less than 1.5 gallons per minute and that you installed a water storage fauk and reverse osmosis
system to address this situation. " Your legal counsel then presented and qualified Brian Thahnann
as an expert in civil engineering. The Commission accepted Mr. Thalmaiin as an expert in civil
engineering. Mr. Thalmann testified that he had personal kiiowledge of the site through a site
inspection. Mr. Thalmann further testified that no other physical location was available on the
property to site another well. Mr. Robert Ferrari was called next and presented and qualified as an
expert in water supply. Mr. Ferrari testified that he was personally familiar with die site and status
of the well and treatment system since his company had been assisting you in obtaining sufficient
water quantity and water quality from your existing well since 2018. Mr. Ferrari also testified that
you reside at the property seasonally. Mr. Ferrari further stated that while the well yield meets the
depth-to-yield standard, the water quality is not suitable as potable water without treatment. "'
During questioning by a commissioner, Mr. Ferrari aclmowledged that alternative water supply



options to municipal water were available to the applicants but not preferred options mostly due
to the cost when compared to fhe cost of a municipal water connection. Your legal counsel then
rested his presentation of your application. Since the Commission had three other similar
applications to consider, yow application, along with the other tliree applications, was continued
to the May 6, 2024, Commission meeting,
At the May 6, 2024, Comiiiission meeting your legal counsel presented Mr. Ferrari, who was
previously accepted by the Commission as an expert in water siqpply, to provide additional
testimony. Mr. Fen'ari testified on the need to not only have sufficient water quantity but to have
appropriate drinking water quality." During questiomngby a commissioner of Mr. Saletin, it was
confirmed that the -use of the property is seasonal mostly by two occupants.

Mr. Michael Gray, the Department of Public Works Director and who has responsibility for the
Town's Water and Sewer divisions, appeared and presented areport to the Commission concerning
the Town's water supply and distribution system. Mr. Gray testified fhat fhe Town purchased the
water plant and its water distribution system, from a private company by authorization of a special
act of the General Assembly passed in 1968 and the subsequent approval of the special act by local
referendum/ Mr. Gray testified that the water system purchased by fhe Town only served a limited
geographic area, primarily within tfae village area (referred to as the Urban District in the current
water system supply management plan and rules) and areas south of the village where former
military facilities were located. "' Mr. Gray testified that yoiir property is located to the north of
aiid outside the Urban Water District and that no water service is available to or exists at your
property. Mr. Gray also testified that the Town has no plans to extend the water service system
north of the current boundary of the Urban Water District (which is south of your property). Mr.
Gray also testified that all costs to operate, improve, and maintain the water supply and distribution
system are the responsibility of the ratepayers in the system. Mr. Gray testified that your property
is not part offhe water supply system, and you are not a ratepayer.

Mr. Gray testified that the Town has undertaken significant improvements since its acquisition of
the water supply and distribution system, including but not limited to improvements to the two
surface water reservoirs and adding a ground water well to bolster supply. Mr. Gray testified fliat
the Commission has implemented regulations to reduce water consumption to balance the simply
and demand for water among the current system users. Mr. Gray explained that supply
replenishment is unpredictable since it relies on annual rainfall, and that consumption deinand,
which exceeds supply for up to five (5) months each year, must be closely monitored and regulated
to ensure the contmued capability oftiie system to supply water to current users."'1

At the conclusion of Mr, Gray's testimony, your legal counsel questioned Mr. Gray and advocated
on behalf of your application that the Commission approve yoxur water service extension and
connection request on the basis that your property meets "the standards of the State law.. . ,"vi" The
Commission continued yow application to their May 20, 2024, meeting to allow time for the
commissioners to fhozightfully consider the evidence submitted on behalf of your application
before they begin their deliberations.

At the May 20, 2024, Commission meeting, the commissioners discussed the present conditions
of the Jamestown water system, specifically tfae luiiited supply aiid distribudon network. The
commissioners discussed the past history of the Uttiited water supply, fheir adoption of rules to
limit and reduce consumption of water by systein users to conserve the limited aiid unpredictable
supply, and Ae reasons why the water system is limited to a specific geographic area to ensure



available supply will be adequate to meet current and predicted future system consumption
dematid. The commissioners also discussed the relevant standard of review provision in the Rules
and Regulations of the Board of Water and Sewer Commissioners (Ae "Rules") for water service
extensions outside the Urban District, The Commission discussed the relevance and applicability
of Rule 14.B. of the Rules, which states, in relevant part, at b.4., "Extensions to and within the
rural district shall be prohibited. " However, Ihe Rule provides that "Nothing herein shall be
construed to prohibit or prevent the Board of Water and Sewer Coimnissioners from making such
improvements, mcluditig extensions, wliich shall, in file opinion oftiie Board, improve the quality
or quantity of water furnished to existin water uses (sic)."1"

You were one of four applications seeking a municipal water extension and connection which were
considered by the Commission simultaneously. All four applications concern properties located
on Seaview Avenue. Your property, along wifli flie other fhree application properties, is located
outside of the Urban Water District and has no municipal water supply, distribution lines, or
service. These facts have been true since the creation of the Jainestown Water District in 1968.
Your legal counsel presented two experts and one layperson testimony in support of the
proposition that your property complied with the requirements ofR. 1. General Laws 46-15. 2(b),
Sections 1-7. Neither you, nor any of the other applicants, addressed, offered testimony, or
presented any evidence concerning the relevaiit requirements of the Jamestowii Water and Sewer
Commission Rules, 14,B,b,4. ; to wit, how and whether your application to extend water outside
of the Urban Water District would "improve the quality or quantify of water furnished to existing
water [users]".

The Jainestown Board of Water and Sewer Commissioners was created by a special act of tiie
General Assembly in 1968, in pertinent part, to allow for the purchase of the then-existing
Jamestown Water Company by the Town (the "Act"). The Town voters ratified the special act by
referendum thereby authorizing the Town to purchase the Jamestown Water Company, At Ae tune
of its acquisition, the Jamestown Water Company provided water ser/ice to a geographic area
somewhat synonyinous with the Jamestown Village, so-called. In addition, a water service
distribution line extended south of the Village area to serve areas formerly used as federal defense
installations, to Beavertail and facilities commonly known as Fort Getty and Port Wetherill. In
time and up to fhe present, through the adoption of its water supply and disteibution plan and the
Rules, the Commission has designated the geographic area mostly comprised as the Village as the
Urban Water District and the area south of the Urban District as the Rural Water Distdct. The
Water Supply System Management Plan (the "Plan"), m effect and applicable to your application
specifically shows ttie water service areas at Figure 2. 3. x Figure 2. 3 contains a specific notation
fhat it "shows the boundaries of the Urban Water and Sewer Districts... [and] No future extensions
of water service are planned at this time. " Of particular relevance to your application is that neither
the Act nor the Plan obligate the Commissioners to provide water service everywhere in Town or
to areas outside of the Urban Water District not presently receiving water service. "1 It is undisputed
that your property is located outside of the Urban Water District as shown in Figure 2.3. It is also
undisputed that your property is not receiving municipal water service. Yoiir evidence established
that your property has a private well as its water supply.

It was undisputed on the record that the Act, the Plaii, and the Rules provides the Commission the
discretion to authorize extensions and cormections to the municipal water system for property
located outside of the Urban Water District, such as is the case for your property, In fact, you
offered no evidence to the contrary. Your entire presentation focused on the relevant provisions of



the General Laws 46-15.2(b). Tlie Commission is specifically charged with the obligation to
preserve and protect the water supply and ensure its wise and responsible use."" In addition, the
Commission has flie responsibility to the present users of the water system to provide sufficient
water. By their very nature, extensions, expansions, and new connections outside of the current
water service area are injurious to and endangers the CoiTUiiission's obligations to its present users.
All these facts were considered in the adoption of the Rules, 14,B.(b) requirement that extensions
and connections outside offhe Urban Water District may be authorized when the applicant shows
it will constitute an improvement to the quality or quantity of water furnished to fhe existing water
system users.

Such is not the case here. You offered no evidence to demonstrate or show that your requested
extension and connection had any improvement to the quality or quantity of water furnished to the
existing system users. To the contrary, your application's evidence only showed a benefit to your
property witiiout coflsideration of the detriment to the existing system users, Ae water supply
capacity, or improvement to the quality or quantity of water furnished to existing water system
users. Your sole reliance in making this application was compliance with the General Laws 46-
15.2(b), All the testimony and evidence you entered into fhe record of the hearing on this
application focused on this sole metric. You failed to offer any evidence whatsoever regarding
compliance with the Rules at 14.B.b.4. In conclusion, the Conomission had no evidence or
decisional law presented to it during the coiirse of this hearing to show or demonsb-ate that
Jamestown has to provide water to everybody; that fliis new general law overrules the special act
of the legislature which created the municipal water system or that mere compliance with the
criteria set forth in fhe new general law obligates the water system to extend its distribution lines
and provide a service connection to the applicant; or that, this new general law nullifies the Rules
tliat have been promulgated for the district.

On the preceding basis and for the maiiy reasons stated previously, herein. Commissioner R. White
made a motion to deny this application for an extension and connection of a new water service
outside of the Urban Water District. The motion was seconded by Commissioner Meagher. The
vote was 4 in favor and 0 opposed to the motion. The motion carried by a 4-0 vote.

Very truly yours,

C.-e-

Nancy B eye, hair
Jainestown Water and Sewer Commissioners
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